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The Bulletin of the AlLI'tralianAcaustical Society was established in 1972 as the regular journal of tile Society, and in 1985 its title was 
changed to Acoustics Australia. Its aim has aiwllys been two-fold: to Serve as a medimn for the communication of Society activities to 

members, and 10 promote the development of aooustics in Austnilia by publishing peer-reviewed articles of relevance Ie the Austrulian 

Soon afterthe foITlllJl:ion <lfthe Society in 1964, it was felt that 

there should be some form of regular publication to reflect 
activities, bring acoustical news to the merrIDefli and act as a 

vehicle for publishing articles on AustraliWi acoustical work. 
Early on, Peter Knowland and John Irvine started editing a 
newsletter for the NSW Division. Tn November 1971, the 
Council appIOved the establishment of the Bulletin of the 

Australian Acoustical Society as a replacement of the NSW 
newsletter, the production to alternate between the NSW and 
Victoria Divisions. So, in 1972, the Bulletin of the Australian 
Acoustical Society was born, the New South Wales Division 
agreeing to organise its initial production, Over the nl;Plt few 

years, members of the Editorial Committee included Peter 
Knowland, John Irvine, Ted Weiilon, Ferge Fricke, Richard 
Heggie and Marion Burgas. In 1979, the Victoria Division 
took over responsibility for the production: Robin Alfredson 
was appointed as the Chief Editor followed by Rob Law in 
1980 and Dan Gibson in 198\. 

The Bulletin was snccessful in fulfilling i"lll aims of 
publishing interesting articles based on aconstical work in 
Australia, news concerning the activities of branches and 
members, as well as maintaining good advertiser support The 
editorial committee in Victoria performed a sterling self­
publication effort and in particular ensured a regular schedule 
of three issues per year, which was all important for continued 
advertising revenue. The voluntary time and work applied to 
this task enabled the Bulletin to be produced with a profit 
margin. There was a growing feeling, however, that there was 
a need for changes in presentation and production to reflect 
the growing national andintemational scope of the Society. In 
1982, the production moved back to New South Wales with 
Howard Pollard as Chief Editor and Marion Burgess as 
Associate Editor. The new editorial team was given the 
authority and additional rmance by the Council to carry out 
this process. 

For the first issue of Volume 10 in April 1982, Artsett 

Services were commissioned to redesign and layout a new-

look Bulletin. In addition to the two editors, a number of 
Consulting Editors were appointed, one for each major branch 
of acoustics, whose tasks included acting as referees and 
coordinators of contributions for special issues on their 
particular topics. To assist in the collection of news items, a 
liaison offict:r was appointed in each member state, We even 
had a volunteer cartoonist, Doug Cato, from RANRL, and a 
columniiil, Gracmc Harding, for a new 'People' page. 

In a statement of policy in the first editorial, the editor 
stated: "Following the lead of previous editorial committees, 
it is our intention to convert the Bulletin into a iilandard 
tecbnicaljoumal. The Bulletin has a dual role to play. Firstly, 
it provides an outlet fur infonnation relating to local activities 
and members' peregrinations (contrary to rumour, 'Gossip' 
has uot been pensioned offbut will bc included under the new 
heading 'People'). Secondly, the Bulletin is available for 

publishing both short and long technical articles. While 
original papers will be most welcome, there is room for 
informative review papers (especially in areas of interest in 
Australia), discussion and tutorial papers and short papers 
giving preliminary reports of investigation or research. With 
the active cooperation of those who feel the urge to write (or 
can be persuaded to do so) we hope to continue the process of 
producing an interesting and informative journal that will be 
pnmarily directed towards Australian acousticians and those 
with a general interest in acoustics, but hopefully will also 
present an active image to our many international subscribers," 

Mainly due to one-off expenses associated with the re­
design, the cost of producing Volume \0 No.1 was 
considerably more than had been estimated. After exploring a 
number of alternative printing procedures, a change was made 
to the Cronulla Printing Co, a family business with a 
reputation for quality printing and modest costs. Right from 
tbe start there was debate over our decision to use glossy cover 
and paper, which many members associated with expeusive 
business publications. Advertisers were happy as they were 
able to plan for improved presentations. As it transpired, 
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occasional satirical notes received the thumbs dowlI. It 
appeared that there ",as a limited scope for humour in 
acoustics. Other journals have found the sume reaction, 

which ,aves more time and costs 
In December 1989, Mrs Leigh Wallbank wa~ appointed as 
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